
 

   
 

   
   

     
     

     
  

  
   

  
     

 
     

  

  
     

     
     

  
   

     
       

      
   

 

      
   

    
   

        
  

     
 

 
     

   
   

     

Job Postings 01.07.2021 

WSMV-TV Multiple Positions- These positions are located in Nashville, Tennessee  37209. 
WSMV, a Meredith Corporation TV Station, is searching for an Anchor/Reporter who is great at 
both covering news and uncovering news for a shop that truly values enterprise reporting; a 
Content Producer that will assist with the daily flow of news to the newsroom for appropriate 
coverage both on-air and on the station's digital platforms; a Multimedia Journalist that seeks 
out, produces and tells stories on a variety of platforms-television and others; a News Producer 
that creates content for television and other digital platforms;  a Photographer that is 
responsible for gathering video for news, sports and weather broadcasts, and web by shooting 
and editing video for general assignments; a Reporter that develops, writes and reports daily 
news stories and events and presents information live; and a Technical Producer who will be 
responsible for designing and directing the look and feel of newscasts and local programming 
for WSMV-TV. Degree and experience requirements for these positions vary.  For more 
information and/or to apply, please visit http://www.meredith.com/viewjobopenings. 
Applications for many openings will be accepted through 01.21.2021.  Please see the company 
website for specific deadlines.  (12.21.2020) 

Internship Opportunities with Nintendo of America- As a global company, Nintendo values 
diverse perspectives. They are actively building a culture where employees contribute their 
knowledge, ideas, and perspectives so innovation and creativity thrive. Nintendo believes that 
their results are better when their teams represent their potential consumers and fans. 
Opportunities at Nintendo are available in the areas of IT Enterprise Systems, IT Networks, IT 
UX/UI, IT Security, Social Media Marketing, Retail Marketing & Strategy, Procurement & 
Corporate Projects, and Analytics.  They have positions for IT Platform Engineers, UX 
Researchers, Graphic Designers, and IT Software Engineers. Nintendo is welcoming, 
approachable, and respectful - all characters welcome. Visit www.careers.nintendo.com to 
search current job openings.  This information is made available by HBCU Connect. 
(12.23.2020) 

Muletown Rec Lifeguard- This position is located in Columbia, Tennessee. Lifeguards are 
responsible for maintaining all aquatic safety procedures while providing a safe and friendly 
environment for members and patrons to enjoy. An Ellis & Associates’ lifeguard license is 
required.  This position has flexible work hours between Monday and Sunday, 6:00 a.m. to 8:00 
p.m., with the rate of pay to be determined based on experience. For details about the position 
responsibilities and/or to apply, please visit www.muletownrec.com/careers. You may also 
contact Meaghan Ryan at (931) 375-1800 or at am@muletownrec.com for more information. 
(12.28.2020) 

Williamson County Recreation Centers Indoor Sports Complex Part-Time Front Desk Clerks-
These positions are located at 920 Heritage Way in Brentwood, Tennessee 37027.  The Indoor 
Sports Complex is seeking Front Desk Clerks to provide customer service for 15 hours per week 
at $10.00 per hour.  The work hours will include Friday through Sunday evening and weekend 
hours, with possible summer hours at the splash pad office. Please apply at 
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www.wcparksandrec.com. You may also contact Brenda J. Adcock, Administrative Clerk, at 
(615) 370-3471, ext.2111 or at brenda.adcock@williamsoncounty-tn.gov for more information. 
(12.28.2020) 

Grimmett Law Firm Interpreter- This position is located at 3326 Aspen Grove Drive, Suite 310 in 
Franklin, Tennessee.  Grimmett Law Firm needs a Spanish- and English-speaking person to come 
to their office one day each week for two to three hours to call their Spanish-speaking clients 
and help them translate a few documents. The hourly wage for this position is $15.00 per hour 
and work hours are flexible.  If interested, please contact Paige Levy at (615) 256-4468 to 
discuss the position.  You may also email Ms. Levy at plevy@grimmettlawfirm.com for more 
information.  (12.29.2020) 

Costa Vida Fresh Mexican Grill Team Member- This position is located in The Crossings in 
Spring Hill, Tennessee.  Costa Vida is a “fast casual” restaurant which makes fresh Mexican food 
to order.  They are seeking a Team Member to work the cash register and interact with 
customers.  The hourly wage for this position is $10.00 to $12.00 per hour, with work hours 
from either 10:30 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. or 4:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m. or 9:00 p.m.  Applications are 
accepted at costavida.com or you may visit the restaurant for a walk-in interview with a 
manager between 2:00 p.m. and 5:00 p.m., Monday through Friday.  For more information, 
please contact Tim Dene’, Operating Partner, at (615) 922-9820 or at timjdene@gmail.com. 
Interested parties are welcome to text Mr. Dene’ directly at (615) 922-9820.  (01.05.2021) 

Deutsche Bank Summer Internship Program (DBAchieve)- This program is located in New York, 
New York, and is exclusively for sophomores. Deutsche Bank is committing to making diversity 
and inclusivity a vital part of their global work environment. Through training, networking 
sessions, and intensive on-the-job experience, you’ll gain unique insights into the opportunities 
at Deutsche Bank, discover how global banking works, and learn everything you need to choose 
the next step in your career in Financial Services. DBAchieve interns are given the opportunity 
to learn about business from different viewpoints. Working on day-to-day business and on 
special projects, you will contribute to the innovation of new ideas to help Deutsche Bank’s 
business grow and their customers achieve their financial goals. To apply for this program you 
must be a sophomore student.  Successful interns will be invited back following their junior year 
for the Deutsche Bank Internship Program.  The application deadline is February 22, 2021. To 
find out more about Deutsche Bank, please visit www.db.com/careers. This information is 
made available by HBCU Connect. (01.05.2021) 

United States Capitol Police (USCP) Officers (Federal Law Enforcement)- These positions are 
located in Washington, DC.  The USCP is seeking January applicants for entry-level Police Officer 
positions that offer professional development, career growth opportunities in law enforcement, 
and the privilege of protecting the Legislative Branch of federal government. The USCP 
safeguards the Congress, its legislative process, Members of Congress, employees, visitors, and 
facilities to include the United States Capitol Building.  They employ over 2300 sworn and 
civilian personnel from nearly all 50 states and territories.  Officers work 40 hours per week and 
earn annual salaries of $64,173, along with extensive federal benefits and tuition 
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reimbursement.  Applicants must have a high school diploma or GED, be at least 21 years old 
and not older than 39 years, have a U.S. driver’s license and three years of driving experience, 
and be a U.S. citizen.  Apply by January 31, 2021 at www.usajobs.gov.  For more information, 
please visit www.uscp.gov/careers or contact the recruiting office at recruiting@uscp.gov or at 
(866) 561-8727. (01.05.2021) 

United States Government Employment Opportunities in Alabama- There are currently over 
100 posted job openings for federal government positions located across the state of Alabama.  
These are excellent career opportunities and include entry-level positions, positions requiring 
several years of experience, and positions requiring specialized experience.  Jobs are available 
in the Departments of Agriculture, Air Force, Army, Commerce, Defense, General Services, 
Homeland Security, Interior, Justice, Legislature, NASA, Transportation, Treasury, and Veterans 
Affairs. Application deadlines vary.  For more information and/or to apply, please visit 
www.FederalGovernmentJobs.US. (12.18.2020-01.07.2020) 
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